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The article, “COPDGene® 2019: Redefining the 
Diagnosis of Chronic Obstructive Pulmonary 
Disease”1 by the investigators in the COPD Genetic 
Epidemiology (COPDGene®) study and published in a 
Special Issue of this journal in November, is welcomed 
by all (clinicians, epidemiologists, physiologists) in the 
pulmonary community for addressing the long vexing 
problem of identifying, among those at risk for COPD, 
the ones who will indeed progress to clinically and 
spirometrically-evident disease.  The article presents 
8 categories of patients evaluated for progression, all 
of whom were at risk because of “exposure considered 
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positive,” namely smoking at least 10 pack years. 
Unfortunately, former smokers were not distinguished 
from continuing smokers.  Since the classic study 
of Fletcher and Peto2 almost a half century ago, 
continuing smoking has been recognized as a major 
contributor to COPD progression.

Four of the 8 at-risk categories were defined by 
abnormal spirometry.  There was no evidence of 
increased odds of progression for those with only 
abnormal spirometry or those with both abnormal 
spirometry and symptoms; the latter is unexpected 
since those with symptoms alone had an increased 
odds ratio of 1.41.  Perhaps this is an artifact of the 
classification; those with symptoms and abnormal 
spirometry had already progressed. 

On the other hand, those with abnormal computed 
tomography (CT) alone had an odds ratio for 
progression of 1.31 which increased to 1.74 if 
symptoms were also present, to 2.11 if spirometry was 
abnormal and 2.82 if symptoms were present AND 
spirometry was abnormal.  These findings certainly 
point to the importance of CT scans in evaluating the 
course of COPD.  It is indeed fortunate that chest CTs 
are increasingly available to those at risk for COPD 
by virtue of their eligibility for screening because of 
their concomitant risk for lung cancer.  It is incumbent 
on the screening radiologist to be attentive to the 
presence and extent of emphysema in these low-dose 
scans which do not include the expiratory views which 
were part of the COPDGene® 2019 study.  Such a 
broadening of their purview is consistent with attention 
to signs of parenchymal and/or pleural findings of 

http://doi.org/10.15326/jcopdf.6.5.2019.0149
http://doi.org/10.15326/jcopdf.6.5.2019.0149
http://doi.org/10.15326/jcopdf.6.5.2019.0149


80 Letter to Editor: Redefining COPD

journal.copdfoundation.org   JCOPDF © 2020 Volume 7 • Number 2 • 2020

For personal use only. Permission required for all other uses.

pneumoconiosis, to evidence of interstitial lung 
disease and to extent of coronary artery calcification.  
This broadened attention to findings other than those 
indicative of lung cancer has been supported and now 
followed by one of the largest lung cancer screening 
consortia, the International Early Lung Cancer Action 
Program.
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